
 
 

 

2024 Board Member Nominees 
 
 

Alan Richardson joined Dallas Area Rapid Transit (DART) in 1981 and worked in Fleet 
Maintenance before joining Fleet Engineering, where he’s led the Warranty Program 
and Fluids Program; he’s currently on the Operations Engineering Team. Alan served 
on DART Federal Credit Union’s Board of Directors for 20 years and was Chairman of 
the Board. He became a City CU Advisory Director in 2011, a Board Director in 2012 
and Board Chairman in 2018. Past roles include Secretary, Chair of the HR Committee 
and the Political Action Committee and member of the Nominating Committee. Alan 
is active with governmental affairs and engages with state representatives, 
legislators and regulators on key issues as a Credit Union Advocate in Washington, 
D.C. He completed CUNA’s Professional Development Volunteer Achievement 
Program, is a past member of CUES and annually attends director training. Alan 
completed his third term as an elected Trustee of his local school district and is a 
small business owner, part-time rancher and a member of the Texas Cattle Raisers 
Association. He graduated from Texas State Technical College. 

 
 
 

Greg Reichel began his 15-year mortgage career at a credit union. He’s a Senior Vice 
President at City Bank Mortgage and a real estate development small business 
owner. Greg became a City CU Advisory Director in 2019 and was elected as a Board 
Director in 2020. He completed CUNA’s Professional Development Volunteer 
Achievement Program and has served on the Audit Committee and serves on the HR 
Committee. He volunteers with Incarnation Academy in Dallas, MetroTex and is the 
committee chair for The Birthday Party Project. Greg attended the University of 
Oklahoma. 

 
 
 
 

Tony Hobley is the Chief DE&I Officer for Omnicom Precision Marketing Group, a 
large global advertising and marketing communications holding company. His 
background includes leadership positions leading several advertising and marketing 
agencies and managing global client relationships. Tony’s served on the board of 
several community organizations in Dallas. 

 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 


